
Ford needs your help! The company is preparing to unveil
a Performance Package for the 2012 Mustang V6, but it
doesn't have a name for it. So, how can you help? Well,
head on over to Ford's Facebook page and suggest a
name for this future package. Five of the most voted
names will enter the "final" and the winner will be the lucky
one to name the future vehicle.

"We're utilizing the power of social media to not only talk
about what a fantastic package this is, but to also let
Mustang fans across the country share a piece of it," said
Brian McClary, Ford social and emerging media specialist.
"lt's a nontraditional approach to naming a piece of brand
that millions of people identify with."

lf you need a little help coming up with the name then just
look at some of the features associated with it. The
Performance Package includes a 3.31 rear axle ratio for
quicker off-the-line acceleration, Mustang GT coupe front
and rear stabilizer bars, Mustang GT front struts and rear
shocks/springs, and a Shelbv GT500 rear lower control
arm. lt will also come with Mustang GT front and rear
brake calipers with Performance Friction pads, a strut
tower brace for increased body rigidity, a unique electronic
stability control calibration with sport mode for
performance driving, and unique badging, Topping it off
will be 19-inch wheels wrapped in Pirelli


